

Pick Up Frequency	North Region			Central Region			South Region		
	Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin
Weekly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Bi-Weekly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Monthly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Bi-Monthly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Unscheduled (additional) Pick up									
Average Cost per Bin Size				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Average Cost per Region				\$0.00			\$0.00		

**Pricing is to be all inclusive and is per location within a Region.*
*** Additional / Separate cost (i.e. mileage, fuel) will NOT be accepted*

Pick Up Frequency	North Region			Central Region			South Region		
	Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin	28 - 32 Gal Bin	60 - 70 Gal Bin	90 - 100 Gal Bin
Weekly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Bi-Weekly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Monthly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Bi-Monthly				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Unscheduled (additional) Pick-up									
Average Cost per Bin Size				\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Average Cost per Region				\$0.00			\$0.00		

**Pricing is to be all inclusive and is per location within a Region.*

**** Additional / Separate cost (i.e. mileage, fuel) will NOT be accepted**

1 Time Purge	0 - 100 Banker Boxes	100- 200 Banker Boxes	201 -300 Banker Boxes	301 - 400 Banker Boxes	400 + Banker Boxes
On-Site					
Off-Site					

	Cost Per
Media Bin (CDs, Flash Drive, Floppy Disk, Mico- Film, etc.)	
Hard-Drives	

*Pricing is to be all inclusive and is per location within a Region.
 ** Additional / Separate cost (i.e. mileage, fuel) will NOT be accepted